IFB 020-19

ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

BID ANALYSIS
BIDDERS
Varsity Holdings dba All American Sports
Bigger Faster Stronger Inc. BSN Sports, Inc. MFAC, LLC Pyramid School Products Corporation dba Riddell School Specialty
Estimated Uc:]fIt
Item No. |Description Quantity Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 |100’' Measuring tape 5 Each |$ 11.25 | ¢ 56.25 | $ 15.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 8.99 | $ 4495 |$ 1396 | $ 69.80 | $ 12.28 | $ 61.40
2 |150' Measuring tape 6 Each | 9% 15.00 | 5 90.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 9.98 | $ 59.88 No Bid $ 20.99 | $ 125.94
3 |300’ Measuring tape 1 Each |$ 2550 | g 2550 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 15.99 | $ 15.99 |$ 12249 | $ 12249 | $ 27.13 | $ 27.13
4  |4K Shot Put 10 Each |$ 16.50 | $ 165.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 2125 | $ 21250 | $ 26.99 | $ 269.90 $ 1587 | $ 158.70
5 |50" Measuring tape 4 Each |$ 825 | g 3300 $ 10.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 6.98 | $ 27.92 | $ 969 | $ 3876 | $ 12.79 | $ 51.16
6  |8K/12 b Shot Put Each |$ 2250 | g 67.50 | $ 21.00 | $ 63.00 | $ 2595 | $ 77.85 | $ 36.99 | $ 110.97 No Bid $ 18.68 | $ 56.04
7 |Aluminum Benches Each No Bid $ 329.00 $  1,645.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 40527 | $ 2,026.35
8  |Aluminum Relay Batons 51 Each |$ 295 | g 15045 | $ 3.00 | $ 153.00 | $ 4.00|$ 204.00 | $ 298| $ 151.98 | $ 3.09| $ 15759 | $ 33213 169.32
9 |Athletic Field Striper 2 Each |$ 225.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 3.09 | $ 6.18 | $ 119.98 | $ 239.96 $ 109.88 |3 219.76
10 |Baseball Backstop Nets 1 Each No Bid 0.61sqft No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,357.11 (s 1,357.11
11 |Baseball Bases 4 Each No Bid $ 125.00 g 500.00 No Bid $ 799 | % 31.96 |$ 4359 $ 174.36 | $ 36.22 | $ 144.88
12  |Baseball Bats 11 Each No Bid $ 199.95 §  2,199.45 No Bid $ 70.89 779.79 No Bid $ 3411 | $ 375.21
13 |Baseball Batter's Helmet 32 Each No Bid $ 32.00 | $  1,024.00 No Bid 22.95 734.40 No Bid $ 2131 | $ 681.92
14 |Baseball Batting Cage Nets 2 Each No Bid $ 850.00 | $  1,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13311 |3 266.22
15 |Baseball Belts 145 Each |$ 335 | 3 48575 | $ 3.00 | $ 435.00 No Bid $ 169 | $ 245.05 | $ 275 $ 398.75 No Bid
16 |Baseball Catcher's Helmet & Mask Combo 5 Each No Bid $ 40.00 | $ 200.00 No Bid $ 87.95|$  439.75 No Bid $ 3411 | $ 170.55
17  |Baseball Chest Protectors 3 Each |$ 39.75 | $ 119.25 | $ 112.00 | $ 336.00 No Bid $ 87.55 | $ 262.65 No Bid No Bid
18 |Baseball Fungo Bats 9 Each No Bid $ 28.00 | $ 252.00 No Bid $ 29.95 | $ 269.55 No Bid $ 6.39 | $ 57.51
19 |Baseball Home Plate 2 Each No Bid $ 48.00 | $ 96.00 No Bid $ 17.99 | $ 3598 |$ 6478 $ 129.56 | $ 10.23 | $ 20.46
20 |Baseball Pitcher's Plate 3 Each No Bid $ 51.00 | $ 153.00 No Bid $ 14.95 | $ 4485|$ 1655| $ 49.65 No Bid
21 |Baseball Practice Balls 9 Bucket | $ 165.00 | $ 1,485.00 | $ 109.00 | $ 981.00 No Bid $ 49.98 | $ 44982 |$ 9889 | $ 890.01 | $ 41.98 | $ 377.82
22  |Baseball Scorebooks 18 Each |$ 395 | ¢ 7110 | $ 5.00 | $ 90.00 No Bid $ 299 $ 53.82 | $ 359 | $ 64.62 | $ 9.15 [ $ 164.70
23 |Baseball Shin Guards 2 Each |$ 58.00 | $ 116.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 140.00 No Bid $ 89.95 | $ 179.90 No Bid $ 4748 | $ 94.96
25 |Baseball Carts 10 Each |$ 75.00 | 750.00 | $ 125.00 | $  1,250.00 No Bid $ 59.98 | $ 599.80 |$ 49.88| $ 498.80 | $ 98.11 | $ 981.10
26  |Blanks 22 4 Each No Bid $ 40.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
27  |Blanks 32 Each No Bid $ 65.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 |Cross Over Zone Track Protector 1 Each No Bid $ 995.00 | $ 995.00 | $ 915.00 | $ 915.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 |Diamond Digger Combo 1 Each No Bid $ 395.00 | $ 395.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 |Dimple Machine Balls 17 Case No Bid $ 19.00 | $ 323.00 No Bid $ 26.98 | $ 458.66 | $ 198.00 | $  3,366.00 No Bid
31 |Football % Round Dummy 22 Each No Bid $ 70.00 | $  1,540.00 No Bid No Bid $ 65.00| $ 1,430.00 No Bid
32 |Football 1 %" Shoulder Pad T-Hooks 10 Pack No Bid $ 20.00 | $ 200.00 No Bid No Bid $ 2250 $ 225.00 No Bid
33 |Football 25 Second Play Clock 6 Each No Bid $ 1,900.00 | $ 11,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 Football 4 Snap Chin Straps 50 Each No Bid $ 7.00 | $ 350.00 No Bid No Bid $ 475 $ 237.50 No Bid
35 |Football Chain and Down Market Set 4 Each No Bid $ 295.00 [ $  1,180.00 No Bid No Bid $ 199.38| $ 797.52 No Bid
36 |Football Chin strap replacement snaps 10 Pack No Bid $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 No Bid No Bid $ 2500]| $ 250.00 No Bid

TOTAL (In Figures)| $ 672.00 | $ 406480 |$  6,173.95|$ 28730.45|$ 113329 |$ 1,905.53 | $ 800.67 |$ 5507.53 |$ 94389 |$ 890041 |$ 245552 |$ 7,588.24




IFB 020-19

ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

BID ANALYSIS
BIDDERS
Varsity Holdings dba All American Sports
Bigger Faster Stronger Inc. BSN Sports, Inc. MFAC, LLC Pyramid School Products Corporation dba Riddell School Specialty
Unit
Estimated of
Item No. |Description Quantity Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 Football Chin-Strap Buckles 10 Pack $ 16.00 | $ 160.00 $ 40.00 | $ 400.00 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 |Football End Zone Pylons 3 Set $ 27.00 | $ 81.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 414.00 $ 2275|% 68.25
39 |Football Extra Point Tee 12 Each | $ 360 | $ 4320 | $ 3.00 | $ 36.00 No Bid $ 299 | $ 35.88 | $ 425 % 51.00 | $ 33.02 | $ 118.87
40 Football Forearm Dummy 35 Each No Bid $ 20.00 | $ 700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
41 |Football Helmets 368 Each No Bid $ 209.00 | $ 76,912.00 No Bid No Bid $ 25000 |$  92,000.00 No Bid
42 |Football Hip Pads (pair) 193 Pair No Bid $ 650 | $  1,254.50 No Bid No Bid $ 700|s 135100 No Bid
43 |Football Kick-off Tee 9 Each | $ 335 $ 3015 | $ 350 | % 31.50 No Bid $ 298| % 26.82 | $ 425 | s 38.25 No Bid
44 |Football Knee Pads (pair) 460 Pair No Bid $ 3.00|$  1,380.00 No Bid No Bid $ 500|$  230000]$% 383 |s 34.47
45  |Football Long Girdles 227 Each No Bid $ 25.00 | $ 5,675.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1950 |s 4,426.50 No Bid
46  |Football Pop-up Dummy 30 Each No Bid $ 525.00 | $ 15,750.00 No Bid No Bid $ 955.00 | $  28,650.00 No Bid
47  |Football Practice Jerseys 446 Each No Bid $ 8.00 | $ 3,568.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1350 (s 6,021.00 No Bid
48  |Football Practice Pants 494 Each No Bid $ 15.00 | $  7,410.00 No Bid No Bid $ 875 s 4,322.50 No Bid
49  |Football Scrimmage Vests 200 Each |$ 6.39 | $ 1,278.00 | $ 3.00 s 600.00 No Bid $ 189 | $ 378.00 | $ 450 | s 900.00 No Bid
50 |Football Short Girdles 335 Each No Bid $ 8.00 | $  2,680.00 No Bid No Bid $ 6.25 | $ 2,093.75 5.18| s 1,036.00
51 |Football Shoulder Pads 210 Each No Bid $ 159.00 | $  33,390.00 No Bid No Bid $ 120.00 | $  25,200.00 No Bid
52  |Football Standup Dummy 11 Each No Bid $ 98.00 | $  1,078.00 No Bid No Bid $ 145.00 | s 1,595.00 No Bid
53 |Football Tack Wheels 6 Each No Bid $ 250.00 | $  1,500.00 No Bid No Bid $ 29500 s 1,770.00 No Bid
54  |Football Tail Pads 212 Each No Bid $ 2.00 | $ 424.00 No Bid No Bid $ 2253 477.00 No Bid
55  |Football Thigh Pads (pair) 202 Pair No Bid $ 5.00|$ 1,010.00 No Bid No Bid $ 7.65| % 1,545.30 No Bid
56 Football T-Nut Wrench 5 Each No Bid $ 6.00 | $ 30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 |Football T-Nuts 10 Each No Bid $ 1350 | $ 135.00 No Bid No Bid $ 13443 134.40 No Bid
58 |Gadget Bar Lifter 1 Each No Bid $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59 |Goal Post Pads 2 Each No Bid $ 225.00 | $ 450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 |Golf Balls 60 Each No Bid $ 30.00 | $  1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.79| $ 767.40
61 |High Jump Bungees 2 Each No Bid $ 12.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
62  |High Jump Pits 1 Each No Bid $ 6,200.00|$ 6,20000|$% 549500 |%$ 5,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
63 |High Jump Standards 1 Each No Bid $ 295.00 | $ 295.00 | $ 355.00 | $ 355.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
64  |High Jump X-Bar 2 Each No Bid $ 48.00 | $ 96.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 |Hurdles 18 Each No Bid $ 97.00 |$ 1,746.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 1,890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL (In Figures) $ 4034 | $ 1,432.35|$ 843850 |$ 164,764.00 | $ 6,123.00 | $ 8,076.00 | $ 7.86 | $ 440.70 | $1,924.09 | $ 175268.04 | $ 54.82 | $ 1,956.74




IFB 020-19

ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

BID ANALYSIS
BIDDERS
Varsity Holdings dba All American Sports
Bigger Faster Stronger Inc. BSN Sports, Inc. MFAC, LLC Pyramid School Products Corporation dba Riddell School Specialty
Estimated | Unit of
Item No.|Description Quantity | Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

66 Lightning Striker Alert Detectors 15 Each | $ 4034 | $ 605.10 | $ 255.00 | $ 3,825.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 7,875.00 | $ 7998 | $ 1,199.70 No Bid No Bid
67 |Pole vault Pit 1 Each No Bid $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 10,975.00 | $ 32,925.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
68 |Pole Vault Standard Pads 1 Each No Bid $  465.00 | $ 465.00 | $ 144500 | $ 13,005.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 |Pole Vault System 1 Each No Bid $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 15,890.00 | $ 31,780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
70  |Portapit Flight Hurdle Cart 1 Each No Bid $ 650.00 | $ 650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71  |Rubber Discus 1.6K 2 Each |$ 675| $ 1350 | $ 10.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 12.00 216.00 | $ 2.98 | $ 19.96 | $ 859 | $ 1718 | $ 9.98 | $ 19.96
72 |Rubber Discus 1K 2 Each |$ 525 $ 1050 | $ 9.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 799 | $ 15.98 | $ 6.89 | $ 13.78 | $ 6.84 | $ 13.68
73 |Shot Put Netting 1 Each No Bid $ 740.00 | $ 740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
74 |Soccer Corner Flags 2 Each |$ 59.25 | $ 11850 | $ 45.00 | $ 90.00 No Bid $ 59.98 | $ 119.96 [$ 101.50 | $ 203.00 | $ 83.64 | $ 167.28
75 |Soccer Game Balls (Select "Royale” 01-253 40 Each No Bid $ 45.00 | $  1,800.00 No Bid $ 2498 | $ 999.20 No Bid No Bid
76 |Soccer Goals 1 Each No Bid $ 2,200.00 | $  2,200.00 No Bid $ 2,899.95 | $  2,899.95 No Bid $ 20582 |% 205.82
77 |Soccer Nets 3 Each No Bid $ 185.00 | $ 555.00 No Bid $ 50.98 | $ 179.94 No Bid $ 35.90 | $ 107.70
78  |Soccer Practice Balls 97 Each |$ 10.95 | $ 1,062.15 | $ 28.00 | $  2,716.00 No Bid $ 599 | $ 581.03 No Bid $ 14.07 | $ 1,364.79
79  |Soccer Scorebooks 9 Each No Bid $ 6.00 | $ 54.00 No Bid $ 6.49 | $ 58.41 No Bid No Bid
80 |Softball Aluminum Bat 10 Each No Bid $ 225.00 | §  2,250.00 No Bid $ 59.95 | $ 599.50 No Bid No Bid
81 |Softball Bases 3 Each No Bid $ 125.00 | $ 375.00 No Bid $ 18.95 | $ 56.85 No Bid $ 1151 | $ 34.53
82 Softball Batter's Helmet & Faceguard Combo 6 Each No Bid $ 36.00 | $ 216.00 No Bid $ 3895 | $ 233.70 No Bid 3$ 3411 | $ 204.66
83 |Softball Catcher Helmet & Mask Combo 18 Each No Bid $ 60.00 | $  1,080.00 No Bid $ 83.95|$ 1,511.10 No Bid $ 11199 |3 2,015.82
84  |Softball Chest Protector 2 Each |$ 3225 $ 64.50 | $ 40.00 | $ 80.00 No Bid $ 83.75 | $ 167.50 No Bid No Bid
85 |Softball Fungo Bat 2 Each No Bid $ 28.00 | $ 56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10.87 | $ 21.74
86 |Softball Home Plate 2 Each No Bid $ 48.00 | $ 96.00 No Bid $ 13.99 | $ 27.98|$ 6478|$ 12956 | $ 7283 | % 145.66
87  |Softball Pitching Rubber 1 Each No Bid $ 51.00 | $ 51.00 No Bid $ 14.95 | $ 1495 |$ 1655 |$ 16.55 No Bid
88 |Softball Scorebook 18 Each No Bid $ 5.00 | $ 90.00 No Bid $ 299 $ 53.82 | $ 359 | $ 6462 | $ 9.15 | $ 164.70
89 |Softball Shin Guards 6 Each No Bid $ 48.00 | $ 288.00 No Bid $ 82.99 | $ 497.94 No Bid No Bid
90 |Spikes 1/4” 7 Pack No Bid $ 11.00 | $ 77.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 56.00 No Bid $ 815|% 57.05 No Bid
91 |Spikes 1/8” 1 Pack No Bid $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 8.00 No Bid $ 8.15|$ 8.15 No Bid
92  |Sports Cool Portable Water Chiller 15 Each No Bid $ 500.00 | $  7,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
93 |Starter Pistol 32 3 Each No Bid $ 125.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 219.00 | $ 657.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 |Starting Blocks 60 Each No Bid $ 50.00 | $  3,000.00 | $ 84.95 | $ 5,097.00 | $ 69.98 | $ 4,198.80 No Bid No Bid
95 |Steel Drags 1 Each No Bid $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 |Stopwatches 25 Each No Bid $ 8.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 598 | $ 149.50 No Bid $ 17.08 | $ 427.00
97 |Team First Aid Kits 25 Each No Bid $ 69.00 | $ 1,725.00 No Bid $ 2099 | $ 524.75 No Bid $ 9452 | $ 2,363.00
98 |Telescoping X-Bar Placer 1 Each No Bid $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
99 |Tennis Balls 1,200 Each No Bid $ 1.00 [ $  1,200.00 No Bid $ 279|$ 3,348.00 No Bid $ 50.62 | $ 60,744.00
100 |Vaulting Poles 2 Each No Bid $ 329.00 | $ 658.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 9151 | $ 183.02

TOTAL (In Figures)| $ 15479 | $ 1,874.25 | $  30,794.00 | $ 56,847.00 | $ 28,788.95 | $ 92,779.00 | $ 365553 | $ 17,458.52 | $ 218.20 | $ 509.89 | $ 860.44 | $ 68,183.36




IFB 020-19

ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT
BID ANALYSIS

BIDDERS

Varsity Holdings dba

All American Sports

Bigger Faster Stronger Inc. BSN Sports, Inc. MFAC, LLC Pyramid School Products Corporation dba Riddell School Specialty
Estimated | Unit of
Item No.|[Description Quantity | Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
101 |Volleyball Carts 4 Each $ 85.00 | 340.00 79.98| $ 310.92
Volleyball Game Balls (Molten Super Touch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102 |IV58L-3-HS) 20 Each $ 53.50 | $ 1,070.00 23.99| & 479.80
103 _|Volleyball Judges Stand 1 Each NoBy $  27500|s  275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
104 |Volleyball Knee Pads 300 Each |§ 975§ 2,925.00 | $ 13.00 [ $  3,900.00 15.98| $ 4,794.00
105 |Volleyball Nets 2 Each |$ 99.75 | § 19950 |$ 15400 |$  308.00 No Bid 14.98] $ 29.96 No Bid 64.44 | $  128.88
106 |Volleyball PPS System 1 Each No Bid $ 210000 | 3% 2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
107 |Volleyball Practice Balls 60 Each |§ 13.50 | § §10.00 | $ 23.00 | $  1,380.00 No Bid 13.99| $§  830.40 No Bid 19.19 | $§  1,151.40
108 |Volleyball Scorebooks 26 Each No Bid $ 6.00( s 156.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
109 |Weather Cover for High Jump Pits 1 Each No Bid $ 625.00 | $ 625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
110 |Weather Cover for Pole Vault Pits 1 Each No Bid $ 705.00 | $ 705.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
111 |Wilson A9011 NFHS Stamped Softballs 60 Each No Bid $ 92.00|$ 552000 No Bid 67.99| $  4,079.40 No Bid No Bid
112 |Wilson F1003 Football 25 Each No Bid $ 78.00 | §  1,950.00 No Bid 76.98) § 192450 % 10079 |$ 6,047.40 80.83 | $ 2,020.75
113 [Wilson F1005 Football 25 Each No Bid $ 78.00 [ $ 1,950.00 No Bid 69.98| § 1,749.50 No Bid 7423 |$ 185575
114 [Wilson TDY Football 30 Each No Bid $ 4400 | $  1,320.00 No Bid 42.98| §  1,289.40 No Bid 2899 | $  869.70
115 |Wood Discus 1.6K 1 Each |$ 34.50 | § 3450 | $ 18.00 | $ 18.00 No Bid 35.95| $ 35.95 No Bid No Bid
116 |Wood Discus 1K 3 Each |$ 31.50 | § 94.50 | $ 20.00 | § 60.00 No Bid 18.95| § 56.85 No Bid No Bid
117 |Wrestling Headgear 135 Each No Bid $ 30.00| $ 4,050.00 No Bid 21.98| $§ 2,967.30 No Bid No Bid
118 |Wrestling Knee Pads 194 Each No Bid $ 12.00| $ 2328.00 No Bid 908| $ 1,036.12 No Bid No Bid
119 [Wrestling Mat Tape 100 Each |$ 8758 875.00 | $ 6.00 | % 600.00 No Bid 4.98| $  498.00 No Bid No Bid
120 [Wrestling Scorebooks 10 Each No Bid $ 6.00| % 60.00 No Bid 5.99| § 59.90 No Bid No Bid
121 [Baseball 30 Second Shot Clock 5 Each No Bid $ 1,30000|% 650000 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3839 | $ 191.95
122 | Starter Pistol 22 3 Each No Bid $ 115003 34500 |8 219.00 | % 1,314.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total (In Figures)| $ 88.25 | $ 427515 | $ 570000 | $ 34,5000 | % 219.00 | § 1,314.00 | $ 400.71 | $ 20,260.28 | $ 100.79 | $  6,047.40 222.44 | $ 4,938.15

Bid Opened: July 15, 2019

Time: 3:00 p.m.

This is to certify that this is a true and correct copy of the Tabulation of the bids

opened.
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