IFB NO. 016-19 DUAL PURPOSE PAPER

BID ANALYSIS

Category A: 0 a : D g ce 3 Blue 8 olde od
Copy Paper

Unit Cost| Total Cost |Unit Cost| Total Cost |Unit Cost| Total Cost |Unit Cost| Total Cost |Unit Cost Total Cost Grand Total
Contract Paper Group |$ 26.87|$ 228,395.00 | $ 4060|% 10,150.00 | $ 4060 |$ 10,150.00 | $ 40.60 | $10,150.00 | $ 40.60 | $ 10,150.00 | $ 269,184.27
Mac Paper, Inc. $ 2890|$ 24565000 (% 47.55|% 11,887.50|% 4755|% 11,88750|% 47.55|$11,887.50|$ 47.55|$% 11,887.50 | $ 293,419.10
Liberty Paper $ 26.95(% 229,075.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 229,101.95
Office Depot, Inc. $ 3049 |% 25916500 (% 4157 |$ 10,39250 | % 4157 [$ 10,39250 | $ 41.57 | $10,392.50 | $ 4157 | $ 10,392.50 | $ 300,931.77
Efémiiromce $ 2999 |$ 254915.00|$ 3570|% 892500|% 3570 |5 892500|% 47.10|$11,775.00 | $ 47.10|$ 11,775.00 | $ 1,092,637.09
gﬁ:{:gagsera““g $ 2677 |$ 22754500 | $ 42.75|$ 10,687.50 | $ 42.75|$ 10,687.50 | $ 42.75 | $10,687.50 | $ 42.75 | $ 10,687.50 | $ 270,492.77
Cat B: Item 1 Item 2
- R 8 1/2 x 14" - White 11 x 17" - White
Copy Paper

Unit Cost| Total Cost |[Unit Cost| Total Cost Grand Total
Contract Paper Group No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mac Paper, Inc. $ 4755 % 1,902.00| % 3735|% 112050 9% 3,107.40
Liberty Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot, Inc. $ 3900]|% 1,563.60 | % 39.09|% 156360($% 3,127.20
Perimeter Office
Products $ 5499|$ 219960 |$ 5499 ($ 2,199.60 | $ 4,399.20
Veritiv Operating
Company $ 4840($ 1,936.00| $ 3809 |% 152360(% 7,526.40
Bid Opened This is to certify that this is a true and correct copy of the tabulation of bids opened.
Date: Thursday, June 6, 2019 Clayton County Public Schools

Time:

3:00 p.m.

Rose Tookes
Buyer
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