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#0-1 Low Fat Milk - 1%
Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint containers. 1% butterfat, less than 
10% milk solid. Have Vitamin A and Vitamin D. 700000 Each Dairy Pure Code 51985 $ 0.2457 $ 171,990.0 Borden $ 0.23 $ 161,000.0 Prairie Farms $ 0.249 $ 174,300.0

#0-2 Vanilla Fat Free Milk

Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint carton. Nonfat milk. Have Vitamin A 
and Vitamin D. Formulations on flavored milk should be the same as retail.  No Artifical 
flavors or corn syrup. Must have 18 grams of sugar or less per serving. 700000 Each TruMoo Code 47472 $ 0.2535 $ 177,450.0 Borden $ 0.22 $ 154,000.0 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-3 Vanilla Milk- 1%

Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint carton. 1% milk. Have Vitamin A and 
Vitamin D. Formulations on flavored milk should be the same as retail.  No Artifical flavors 
or corn syrup. Must have 18 grams of sugar or less per serving. 700000 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Prairie Farms $ 0.25 $ 175,000.0

#0-4 Stawberry Fat Free Milk

Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint carton.  Nonfat milk.  Have Vitamin A 
and Vitamin D. Formulations on flavored milk should be the same as retail.  No Artifical 
flavors or corn syrup. Must have18 grams of sugar or less per serving. 970000 Each TruMoo Code 46073 $ 0.2661 $ 258,117.0 Borden $ 0.22 $ 213,400.0 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-5 Stawberry Milk-1%

Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint carton.  1% milk.  Have Vitamin A and 
Vitamin D. Formulations on flavored milk should be the same as retail.  No Artifical flavors 
or corn syrup. Must have 18 grams of sugar or less per serving. 970000 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Prairie Farms $ 0.25 $ 242,500.0

#0-6 Chocolate Fat Free Milk

Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint carton.  Nonfat milk.  Have Vitamin A 
and Vitamin D. Formulations on flavored milk should be the same as retail.  No Artifical 
flavors or corn syrup. Must have 18 grams of sugar or less per serving. 970000 Each TruMoo Code 48111 $ 0.2489 $ 241,433.0 Borden $ 0.2375 $ 230,375.0 Prairie Farms $ 0.25 $ 242,500.0

#0-7 Chocolate Milk-1%

Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint carton.  1% milk.  Have Vitamin A and 
Vitamin D. Formulations on flavored milk should be the same as retail.  No Artifical flavors 
or corn syrup. Must  have18 grams of sugar or less per serving. 970000 Each TruMoo Code 47282 $ 0.257 $ 249,290.0 Borden $ 0.2575 $ 249,775.0 Prairie Farms $ 0.25 $ 242,500.0

#0-8 Buttermilk
Markets for Pasteruized Grade A Skim or partially skim Milk and Milk products. Half  Gallon 
containers.  Butterfat 1% and less than 10% milk solid. 50 Each Mayfield $ 1.542 $77.10 Borden $ 1.93 $ 96.5 Barber $ 2.3 $114.99

#0-9 Buttermilk
Markets for Pasteruized Grade A Skim or partially skim Milk and Milk products. Gallon 
containers.  Butterfat 1% and less than 10% milk solid. 350 Each Mayfield $ 3.8451 $ 1,345.785 Borden $ 3.61 $ 1,263.5 Barber $ 4.6 $1,609.99

#0-10 Skim Milk
Markets for Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint containers.  Fat Free butterfat with 
Vitamin A and Vitamin D. 500 Each Dairy Pure Code 51984 $ 0.2331 $ 116.55 Borden $ 0.21 $ 105.0 Prairie Farms $ 0.24 $ 120.0

#0-11 Cottage Cheese

Markets for Pasteruized Grade A  Milk and Milk products. Milk fat added is not more than 
1% of weight of finished products and finished product should cantain no more than 80% 
moisture, #5. 150 Each Dean Code 18821 $ 7.65 $ 1,147.5 Borden $ 7.97 $ 1,195.5 Prairie Farms $ 8.9 $ 1,335.0

#0-12 Sour Cream
Markets for Pasturized  Grade A Milk and Milk products. Less than 4% butterfat, Fat 
minimum of 25% reduction in total fat, #5. 150 Each Dean Code 54017 $ 7.97 $ 1,195.5 Borden $ 7.47 $ 1,120.5 Prairie Farms $ 8.9 $ 1,335.0

#0-13 Lactose Free Milk
Markets for Pasturized  Grade A Milk and Milk products. Half pint containers. Fat Free Milk, 
Lactase Enzyme, Vitamin A and Vitamin D. 6000 Each Dairy Pure code 57001 $ 0.54 $ 3,240.0 Borden $ 0.5 $ 3,000.0 Prairie Farms $ 0.58 $3,479.99

IFB 007-21 Milk and Milk Products
Bid Analysis Summary

Dean Dairy Farms
 dba Mayfield Dairy Farms

New Dairy Kentucky LLC 
dba Borden Dairy

East Side Jersey Dairy formerly Prairie 
Farms

Bid Opened:  October 1, 2020

Time:  3:00 p.m.

This is to certify that this is a true and correct copy of the Tabulation of the bids opened.

Clayton County Public Schools
Rose Tookes
Rose Tookes
Buyer
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